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Are you ready for your job interview? This book is a perfect study guide for digital design engineers or
college students who want to practice real digital logic and RTL questions. The questions were put together
first hand by a professional engineer based upon his own job search with top tier semiconductor companies.

A wide range of information and topics are covered, including: RTL Verilog coding syntax, RTL Logic
Design (including low power RTL design principles), clocking and reset circuits, clock domain crossing
questions, digital design fundamentals, and logical thinking questions.

The book contains over 50 digital interview questions, 41 figures and drawings, and 28 practical Verilog
code examples, and is a perfect tool to help you succeed on your interview.

By the end of this book, you will have the insight and knowledge of the types of digital design interview
questions being asked in the field of semiconductor digital design today.
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From reader reviews:

Stuart Ross:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions book is readable simply by
you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer regarding
Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions content conveys the idea easily to understand by lots of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different available as it. So , do you
continue to thinking Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Kelli Smith:

The experience that you get from Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions may be the more deep
you rooting the information that hide into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to know but Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions giving you
enjoyment feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood
simply by anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. This kind of
book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of Digital
Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions instantly.

Chad Davis:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview
Questions, you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-
out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Glenn Connelly:

The book untitled Digital Logic RTL & Verilog Interview Questions contain a lot of information on this. The
writer explains the girl idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so
do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue reading your
smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice examine.
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