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Selecting the best materials, techniques and systems for each project and then specifying them correctly to
meet all the requirements of quality, time, value, constructability, maintenance and durability is a
fundamental aspect of architectural design. It also helps to determine the quality and environmental impact
of the project.

Specifying Buildings: A Design Management Perspective  provides a unique insight into the entire
specification process, from selecting materials and products to writing the specification, dealing with
changes and minimising risk. This new edition has been extensively revised and includes new case studies,
research findings and reviews to illustrate how to translate design intent into building assembly.

The book is structured to meet the needs of students on construction-related programmes such as
architecture, engineering, surveying and construction management. It provides valuable insights and
practical guidance, with end of chapter exercises helping students achieve a thorough understanding of the
specification process
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Gonzales:

This Specifying Buildings usually are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why.
The reason of this Specifying Buildings can be among the great books you must have is usually giving you
more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that possibly will shock your
previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Specifying Buildings giving you an enormous of
experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in
your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Katherine Humphrey:

Typically the book Specifying Buildings has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get
a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research
just before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after looking
over this book.

Vincent Mireles:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Specifying Buildings that give
your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can
be said as the means for people to know world better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't
be explained constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to be
success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Specifying
Buildings become your personal starter.

Sharon Hafer:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just very little students that has
reading's heart or real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library.
They go to right now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not
important, boring as well as can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very
important for yourself. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word
says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Specifying Buildings can make you feel more
interested to read.
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