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The performance of software systems is dramatically affected by how well software designers understand the
basic hardware technologies at work in a system. Similarly, hardware designers must understand the far
reaching effects their design decisions have on software applications. For readers in either category, this
classic introduction to the field provides a deep look into the computer. It demonstrates the relationship
between the software and hardware and focuses on the foundational concepts that are the basis for current
computer design.

Using a distinctive "learning by evolution" approach the authors present each idea from its first principles,
guiding readers through a series of worked examples that incrementally add more complex instructions until
they have acquired an understanding of the entire MIPS instruction set and the fundamentals of assembly
language. Computer arithmetic, pipelining, and memory hierarchies are treated to the same evolutionary
approach with worked examples and incremental drawings supporting each new level of sophistication. The
design, performance, and significance of I/O systems is also discussed in depth, and an entire chapter is
devoted to the emerging architectures of multiprocessor systems.

* Real Stuff provides relevant, tangible examples of how the concepts from the chapter are implemented in
commercially successful products.
* Fallacies and Pitfalls share the hard-won lessons of the authors and other designers in industry.
* Big Pictures allow the reader to keep major insights in focus while studying the details.
* Key terms, all fully defined in an end-of-book glossary, summarize the essential ideas introduced in the
chapter.
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From reader reviews:

Todd McCrea:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Computer
Organization and Design: The Hardware/Software Interface? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
recognize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree
with their opinion or you have some other opinion?

Mary Kidd:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy read one
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Computer Organization and Design: The
Hardware/Software Interface is kind of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Marcela Beach:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Computer Organization and Design: The
Hardware/Software Interface can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these
guides have than the others?

Dave Arreola:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their
passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So ,
this Computer Organization and Design: The Hardware/Software Interface can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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