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A decorated Vietnam veteran, scholar, and father, Curtis E. Dixon hoped to live a comfortable, fulfilling life
in his hometown of Winston-Salem, North Carolina. For nineteen years, he performed managerial and
operational duties within and outside his area of expertise in an outstanding manner with the City. But false
and degrading comments from Deputy City Manager John P. Bond changed his career forever.

Dishonor Everywhere, But Who Cares?????? is the frightening true story of how one man's honor and
reputation was systematically destroyed through the spiteful actions of a select group of individuals. In a
tangled mixture of discrimination, racism, and office politics, Dixon filed a grievance against his employer.
Reeling from daily harassment that affected his health, Dixon had no recourse but to file a lawsuit against the
city.

When the case went to trial in 1984, Dixon was confident the truth would be revealed. Unfortunately, the
media refused to cover the Dixon trials, and deals were made outside of the courtroom that negatively
affected the outcome. Dixon's case was eventually dismissed by all levels of the federal and state judicial
systems except the state appeals court level. After the above, City Manager Stuart terminated Dixon's
employment with the city in 1989, citing the same types of false reasons that were used throughout his court
proceedings.

Dishonor Everywhere, But Who Cares?????? tells Dixon's side of the story, warts and all, and Reveals a
corrupt web of betrayal from elected officials and a large cast of Dixon's neighbors, co-workers and fellow
citizens. Dixon's candor reveals a determination to set the record straight and to finally let the truth speak for
itself.
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From reader reviews:

Randolph Dilworth:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed Dishonor
Everywhere, But Who Cares?? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend
your time with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have
additional opinion?

James Babb:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How people
have to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book.
Looking at a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Dishonor Everywhere, But
Who Cares? book as this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Antonio Fells:

Dishonor Everywhere, But Who Cares? can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The writer
giving his/her effort that will put every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Dishonor Everywhere,
But Who Cares? nevertheless doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and also based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into
fresh stage of crucial thinking.

Opal Moffett:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication Dishonor Everywhere, But Who Cares? was filled regarding science.
Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to
read a publication. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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