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After little Icarus and his dad make a bird-shaped kite, Dad warns Icarus to hold on to the string and not let it
fly too high. But Icarus disobeys, and soon the kite gets caught in the trees! Dad helps him repair the kite so
they can play with it again, and Icarus learns the importance of being careful. Joan Holub’s carefully crafted
text is brought to life by Leslie Patricelli’s famously humorous illustrations. Includes a summary of the
original Icarus myth.
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From reader reviews:

Sandy Holiday:

The actual book Mini Myths: Be Careful, Icarus! has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this
book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes
some research just before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can obtain the point
easily after reading this book.

Ciara Wolfe:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do you think
reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright you can have the e-
book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Mini Myths: Be Careful, Icarus! which is
keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Lawrence Seay:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Mini Myths: Be Careful, Icarus! was multi-
colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Mini Myths: Be Careful, Icarus! has many
kinds or style. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can
read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it can
make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading which.

Nancy Jones:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library
or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real
their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Mini Myths: Be Careful, Icarus! can make you truly feel more
interested to read.
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