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Named a 2013 Doody's Essential Purchase!

I recommend this book as an introduction to new educators involved in clinical teaching."--Journal for
Nurses in Staff Development

This textbook presents a comprehensive framework for planning, guiding, and evaluating learning activities
for undergraduate and graduate nursing students in clinical settings.

The book presents clinical teaching strategies that are effective and practical in a rapidly changing health
care environment. It describes a range of teaching strategies useful for courses in which the teacher is on-site
with students, in courses using preceptors, in simulation laboratories, and in distance education
environments.

This book represents the cutting edge of educational strategies, examining innovative uses of virtual reality,
game-based learning, and nontraditional sites for clinical teaching. Also discussed are culturally inclusive
strategies, methods incorporating current technologies, and strategies for teaching students with disabilities.

Key Topics:

Choosing clinical learning assignments●

Self-directed learning activities●

Case method, case study, and grand rounds●

Clinical Nurse Educator Examination Detailed Test Blueprint core competencies●

Evaluation strategies and grading for written assignments●

Ethical and legal issues in clinical teaching●

Recognizing that clinical settings require different approaches to teaching, the contributors present all the
tools necessary to help educators meet the challenges of this complex learning environment.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Christopher:

This book untitled Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing, Third Edition (Clinical Teaching Strategies in
Nursings) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because when you read this book you
can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can
order it through online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read
this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you to past this
reserve from your list.

Roy Taylor:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can satisfy your
short space of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be go through.
Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing, Third Edition (Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursings) can be your
answer since it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.

Sharon Scott:

This Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing, Third Edition (Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursings) is
completely new way for you who has fascination to look for some information mainly because it relief your
hunger associated with. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still
having bit of digest in reading this Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing, Third Edition (Clinical Teaching
Strategies in Nursings) can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this book is
easy to get by anyone. These books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yeah I mean
in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is
the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book style for your better
life and also knowledge.

Debra Shortt:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing,
Third Edition (Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursings) or maybe others sources were given know-how for
you. After you know how the good a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created
for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In
various other case, beside science book, any other book likes Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursing, Third



Edition (Clinical Teaching Strategies in Nursings) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types
of book like this.
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