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For a hundred and fifty years, historians have debated contradictory claims about the origins of the Mexican
War and ignored the impact of the social, historical, and geographical features of both the United States and
Mexico on that war. Instead, scholars have focused primarily on military strategy and campaigns.

“North American historiography,” claims El Colegio de México historian Josefina Zoraida Vázquez, “has
elucidated all aspects of the war: battles, strategy, weapons, casualties, desertions, background of the
soldiers, finances, and regional variations. Mexican scholars, until recently, have preferred not only to avoid
the war, but also the thankless period of national life that proceeds from independence to the end of the
conflict.”

Dueling Eagles brings together essays by respected American and Mexican scholars to reveal unparalleled
views of the war, including the influence of Great Britain, the role of the first war correspondents and how
their dispatches were perceived in Mexico and America, and the reasons for the collaboration by many
Mexicans with United States troops. The portrayals of the two countries’ viewpoints create a better
understanding of the war’s significance, not only on each nation’s history but also on the international
relationship that remains despite the demarcation of the greatly disputed U.S.-Mexican border.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Farr:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just
watching TV, or even playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly,
that is look different you can read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read
you can spent all day long to reading a e-book. The book Dueling Eagles: Reinterpreting the Mexican-U.S.
War, 1846-1848 it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were
holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too
costly but this book provides high quality.

Judith Craig:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get great
deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have
read is usually Dueling Eagles: Reinterpreting the Mexican-U.S. War, 1846-1848.

Na Urquhart:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Dueling Eagles: Reinterpreting the
Mexican-U.S. War, 1846-1848 publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
uncertainty Dueling Eagles: Reinterpreting the Mexican-U.S. War, 1846-1848 as good book not just by the
cover but also from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do
you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Diane Wilson:

The book untitled Dueling Eagles: Reinterpreting the Mexican-U.S. War, 1846-1848 contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very clear to see
all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was written by famous author.
The author provides you in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If
you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice read.
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