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Bestselling 5 Star Graduation Gift for both College and High School grads! Why do high schools and
colleges require students to take courses in English, math and science, yet have absolutely no requirements
for students to learn about personal money management? Why Didn't They Teach Me This in School? 99
Personal Money Management Lessons to Live By was initially developed by the author to pass on to his five
children as they entered adulthood. As it developed, the author realized that personal money management
skills were rarely taught in high schools, colleges and even in MBA programs. Unfortunately, books on the
subject tend to be complicated, lengthy reads. The book includes eight important lessons focusing on 99
principles that will quickly and memorably enhance any individual's money management acumen. Unlike
many of the personal money management books out there, this book is a quick, easily digested read that
focuses more on the qualitative side than the quantitative side of personal money management. The
principles are not from a text book. Rather, they are practical principles learned by the author as he navigated
through his financial life. Many are unorthodox in order to be memorable and provoke deeper thought by the
reader. Not only an excellent graduation gift for high school and college students but also a great read for
any adult!
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From reader reviews:

Clyde Welch:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Why Didn't They Teach Me
This in School?: 99 Personal Money Management Principles to Live By. All type of book could you see on
many methods. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Joanna Weekley:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to remain than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Why Didn't They
Teach Me This in School?: 99 Personal Money Management Principles to Live By book as basic and daily
reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Jesse Kennedy:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you
study a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us
novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Why Didn't They Teach Me This in School?: 99 Personal Money
Management Principles to Live By provide you with new experience in studying a book.

Melanie Young:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The
particular book that recommended for your requirements is Why Didn't They Teach Me This in School?: 99
Personal Money Management Principles to Live By this book consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.
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