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With settlements stretching across a vast expanse--from Newfoundland in North America to Kiev in the heart
of the Ukraine--and with legends of their exploits extending even farther, the Vikings were the most far-
flung and feared people of their time. Yet the archaeological and historical records are so scant that the true
nature of Viking civilization remains shrouded in mystery. Who were these seafaring warriors from the
North? Were they, as their southern enemies claimed, "a wrathful, foreign, purely pagan people" who swept
in from the sea to plunder and slaughter? Or were they remarkably successful merchants and explorers
forced into war out of geographic necessity?
In The Oxford Illustrated History of the Vikings, twelve leading scholars draw on the latest research and
archaeological evidence to provide the clearest picture yet of this fabled people. Painting a fascinating
portrait of the influences that the "Northmen" had on foreign lands, the contributors trace Viking excursions
to the British Islands, Russia, Iceland, Greenland, and the northern tip of Newfoundland, which the Vikings
called "Vinlund." We also meet the great Viking kings: from King Godfred, King of the Danes, who led
campaigns against Charlemagne in Saxony; to King Harald Bluetooth, the first of the Christian rulers, who
helped unify Scandinavia and introduced a modern infrastructure of bridges and roads; to King Knut, who
invaded England and proved a dangerous adversary to William the Conquerer. The volume also looks at the
day-to-day social life of the Vikings, describing for instance their almost religious reverence for boats and
boat-building, a deep bond with the sea that is still visible in the etymology to English words for "anchor,"
"boat," "rudder," "ship," and "fishing," all of which can be traced back to Old Norse roots. But perhaps most
important, the book goes a long way towards answering the age-old question of who these people were.
Were they, as their contemporaries asserted, just a motley assortment of savage pagans, to be reviled by the
Church and society? The contributors show that the Vikings did indeed control the Northern Seas with the
viciousness of pirates and that they pillaged Christian towns with relentless ferocity. And yet we also
discover that they were shrewd traders whose dealings in fur in Russia and walrus tusks in Iceland were the
envy of Europe.
Attractively illustrated with 24 color plates, 16 maps, and over a hundred black-and-white pictures, The
Oxford Illustrated History of the Vikings is a superb account of this rugged maritime culture. From sagas to
shipbuilding, from funeral rites to the fur trade, this superb volume is an indispensable guide to the Viking
world.
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From reader reviews:

Joel Fallis:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and progress. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Oxford Illustrated History of
the Vikings (Oxford Illustrated Histories) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Edward Gilbert:

The book The Oxford Illustrated History of the Vikings (Oxford Illustrated Histories) will bring you to the
new experience of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to
find new book to see, this book very acceptable to you. The book The Oxford Illustrated History of the
Vikings (Oxford Illustrated Histories) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Calvin Fischer:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Oxford Illustrated History
of the Vikings (Oxford Illustrated Histories), you can enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish
to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it,
oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Barbara Gunter:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book The Oxford Illustrated History of the Vikings (Oxford
Illustrated Histories) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is
developing when you such as reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the idea about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open up a book
and read it. Beside that the guide The Oxford Illustrated History of the Vikings (Oxford Illustrated Histories)
can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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