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The assignment:
Over a period of approximately ten weeks, the Holy Spirit of God took me on several supernatural journeys
with the following clear assignment: “You must write down everything, and publish it in book form. The
content of the book must be simple so that everyone can understand it.”
“Write the vision and engrave it so plainly upon tablets that everyone who passes may (be able to) read (it
easily and quickly) as he hastens by.” Habakkuk 2:2 (Amplified Bible).
Together with the prophet Isaiah in Isaiah 49:5, I want to answer: “The Lord gave me an important
assignment, and God will empower me to complete it.” On the isle of Patmos, the apostle John received a
similar commission. He writes in Revelations 1:10: “On the Lord’s Day I was in the Spirit, and I heard
behind me a loud voice like a trumpet, which said: “Write down what you see and send it to the seven
churches.”

I realise that there may be people who will read this book with misgivings, or doubt, and may even regard it
as purely a flight of the imagination. My purpose is not to convince any one person of my spiritual journeys.
What must be revealed, the Spirit of the Lord will reveal, and also to those who are ready to understand it.
(Jeremiah 33:3). In 1 Corinthians 2:9 Father God confirms: “No eye has seen, no ear has heard, no mind has
conceived what God has prepared for those who love Him” (NIV). I want to agree with 1 Corinthians 2:13 –
15: “This is what we speak, not in words, taught us by human wisdom but in words taught by the Spirit,
expressing spiritual truths in spiritual words. The man without the Spirit does not accept the things that come
from the Spirit of God, for they are foolishness to him and he cannot understand them, because they are
spiritually discerned. The spiritual man makes judgment about all things, but he himself is not subject to any
man’s judgment”.
The Father God has no favourites. He is no discerner of persons. He longs to have an intimate relationship
with every one of his children. Because God is a supernatural Being, it is understandable that He will
communicate with us through his Spirit, as John 4:24 explains: “God is spirit, and his worshippers must
worship in spirit and in truth.”
“Satan is a person. He is a reality,” I clearly heard God say during one of my journeys. “Do not for one
moment underestimate his craftiness and lies.” Satan will try in any which way to deter the children of the
living God from walking the road of salvation. But his time is running out. He will try with even greater
cunning to drag the children of the Light over the abyss and into the depths of his eternal darkness. It is only
by the blood of the Lamb of God, Jesus Christ, Yeshua Ha Maschiach, and through the working of the Holy
Spirit, that we will be covered and remain strong enough to resist the relentless attacks of the enemy.

Therefore we must be willing and receptive to be guided by the Holy Spirit in all truth, so that we can
experience eternal glory and joy with our heavenly Father in the next life.

In John 16:13-15 Jesus explains: “But when he, the Spirit of truth, comes, he will guide you into all truth. He
will not speak on his own; he will speak only what he hears, and he will tell you what is yet to come. He will
bring glory to me by taking from what is mine and make it known to you. All that belongs to the Father is
mine. That is why I said that the Spirit will take from what is mine and make it known to you” .
Father God longs for an intimate relationship with each one of us; He wants us to listen to, and hear his
voice. In Numbers 12: 5-8, God says the following about his servant Moses: “Then the Lord came down in a
pillar of cloud; he stood at the entrance to the Tent and summoned Aaron and Miriam. When both of them



stepped forward, he said, “Listen to my words: “When a prophet of the LORD is among you, I reveal myself
to him in visions, I speak to him in dreams.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Mazzarella:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that
e-book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who
don't like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Secrets of Hell Revealed.

Sandra Mendoza:

The book Secrets of Hell Revealed make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your
capable far more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem
with the subject. If you can make studying a book Secrets of Hell Revealed to get your habit, you can get far
more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects.
You can know everything if you like open and read a reserve Secrets of Hell Revealed. Kinds of book are a
lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Linda Cooper:

The publication untitled Secrets of Hell Revealed is the e-book that recommended to you to study. You can
see the quality of the book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that writer use to explained
their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of investigation when write
the book, therefore the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also
could possibly get the e-book of Secrets of Hell Revealed from the publisher to make you considerably more
enjoy free time.

Gabriel Badger:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Secrets of Hell Revealed can be the solution, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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