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Book 1 in the Area 51 series Since before the dawning of modern man, an alien mothership and nine
abandoned flying saucers have been hidden away in Area 51, a top-secret military base in the Nevada desert.
There, scientists have studied the crafts, hoping to unlock the secrets of the alien technology and, perhaps,
the origins of life on Earth. But now a deranged general wants to activate the mothership’s interstellar
drive—and the consequences could prove catastrophic for humankind. Dr. Hans Von Seeckt—an elderly
scientist, ex-Nazi, and original member of the Area 51 research team—joins up with the president’s science
adviser, Dr. Lisa Duncan, and Special Forces officer Mike Turcotte to put a stop to the planned test flight
and tell the public the truth about Area 51. Meanwhile, a brilliant archaeologist, Professor Nabinger,
discovers a message on runes found in ancient Egypt that could change everything we think we know about
human evolution and the role that alien visitation may have played in it. From the Inside Flap When nine
atmospheric crafts of unknown origin were discovered in the Antarctic in the late 1940s, the U.S.
government established Area 51 to study the abandoned technology. Dr. Hans Von Seeckt, who is the only
original member of the secret research committee, has observed the marvelous craft in flight and witnessed a
fantastic array of bizarre, unexplained phenomena. But Dr. Van Seeckt fears that the technology of the
mothership is beyond our scope and an explosive threat to the entire planet. He must race against time to
unlock the secret of the ship--and to the origins of mankind itself.
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From reader reviews:

Andre Roberts:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or
something that they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Area 51
(Volume 1). All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or
other social media.

Donald Hamann:

The event that you get from Area 51 (Volume 1) could be the more deep you digging the information that
hide within the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Area 51 (Volume 1) giving you joy feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this publication is
well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it
is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you
for having this Area 51 (Volume 1) instantly.

Lilian Anderson:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you is Area 51 (Volume 1) this publication consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. That book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some study
when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.

Jon Pittenger:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Area 51 (Volume 1) can give you a lot of close friends
because by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't and make you actually more like an
interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer
you information that might be your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than different make you to be
great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Area 51 (Volume 1).
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